
A-Turf, Inc. 385 
Williamsville NY
A-Turf, Inc. specializes in the
sales and installation of both
in filled and conventional
synthetic grass systems for
athletic fields. A-Turf’s focus
is to provide superior
synthetic grass systems
combined with exceptional
installation and after sales
service.  
www.aturf.com 

ADS, Inc. 538 
Hilliard OH
Advanced Drainage Systems,
Inc., the largest manufac-
turer of HDPE drainage pipe,
provides solutions for
residential projects to
highway drainage.  With a
product line that includes
AdvanEDGE®, ADS PolyFlex™
and Nyloplastâ products look
no further than ADS for the
best in golf course drainage
solutions all designed to
ensure maximum playability
after the storm.  
www.ads-pipe.com

Aer-Flo, Inc. 337
Bradenton FL
Aer-Flo, Inc. manufactures
unique sports covers,
including patented Wind
Weighted® Baseball Tarps
and Bench Zone™ Sideline
Turf Protectors.
www.aerflo.com

AerWay By SAF-HOLLAND 501
Surrey BC
AerWay is an innovative
world leader in the
manufacture of soil aeration
equipment for agriculture,
golf courses, sports fields,
orchards and vineyards.
Safety, durability, economical
operation and promoting the
sustainable use of natural
resources are all hallmarks
of AerWay-The Original.
www.aerway.com

Agrium Advanced 
Technologies 324
Loveland CO 
Agrium Advanced
Technologies is the leading
manufacturer and marketer
of slow- and controlled-
release fertilizers and
micronutrients in the
professional Turf and
Ornamental markets. Agrium
Advanced Technologies’
brands include XCU,
NITROFORM, NUTRALENE,
POLYON, DURATION CR and
Spread It & Forget It
slow- and controlled-release
fertilizers and AMP
Micronutrients.
www.spreaditandforgetit.com 

All Seasons Turf 564
Brookshire TX
Whether you need sprigs,
blocks, pallets or even big
rolls, All Seasons Turf is big
enough to handle any size
project while maintaining a
personalized relationship to
assure every detail is right
the first time.
www.allseasonsturf.com

Aquasmart Global 570
Waterville OH
Aquasmart is a premiere water
retention product holding 12
times its weight in water.
www.aquasmartglobal.com

Aquatrols 390
Paulsboro NJ
Products that help to
improve and maintain your
root zone environment.  
www.aquatrols.com

Arysta Life Science 279
Easton MD
Basic manufacturer of
Disarm Fungicides, Aloft
Insecticide, Endorse
Fungicide and Xonerate.
www.arystalifescience.com 

Bannerman LTD 409
Rexdale Ontario Canada
Aeration equipment, large
turf rollers, topdressing ma-
chines, infield groomers, wet
and dry liners, overseeding
equipment and turf combs.
www.sportsturfmagic.com

Barenbrug Seed 357
Tangent OR
Barenburg’s innovative
programs of research and
turfgrass development are
designed to provide varieties
that afford the highest level
of sports turf performance.
Our RPR Regenerating Peren-
nial Ryegrass and HGT Brand
of wear tolerant Kentucky
bluegrasses are recent top
innovations in sports turf
performance. 
www.barusa.com 

BASF 287
Ames IA
Manufacturer of Green
Lounger, turf paint products,
sprint iron, biostimulants
and other turf management
products.
www.beckerunderwood.com

Bayer 213
Research Triangle Park NC
Bayer is a global enterprise
with core competencies in
the fields of health care,
agriculture and high-tech
materials. This year the
company is celebrating 150
years of Bayer – consistent
with its mission “Bayer:
Science For A Better Life”.
In the area of sports turf
management, Bayer
CropScience has a broad
portfolio of products to
control weeds, disease, ne-
matodes, and turf damaging
insects. 
www.backedbybayer.com

Beacon Athletics 413
Middleton WI
Supplies soil amendments,
field maintenance
equipment, custom netting,
padding, windscreens and
more.  
www.beaconathletics.com

Buffalo Turbine 391
Springville NY
Since 1945, Buffalo Turbine
has used “Turbine
Technology” with our vast
number of blowers and
sprayers. 
www.buffaloturbine.com

Bulldog Field Equipment 490
Roanoke VA
At Bulldog Field Equipment,
we strive to design and offer
innovative tools and
equipment to help sports
turf professionals reduce
stress, labor and equipment
costs.
www.bulldogfield
equipment.com

List of Exhibitors
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Burnside Services 484
Navasota TX
We are a family owned and
operated athletic field
construction company built
on integrity, productivity and
quality.  We have specialized
in all types of high quality
field construction for over
twenty years.
www.burnside-services.com

Bush Turf 656
Milan IL
Bush Turf provides three
dimensional field construc-
tion, renovation and design. 
www.bushturf.com

C & H Baseball, Inc. 220
Bradenton FL
C & H Baseball is the indus-
try’s leader in new stadium
construction netting and field
equipment. Supplying and
installing field wall padding,
windscreen, barrier nets,
batting tunnels and artificial
turf. We have successfully
become a “one-stop” shop
for all of your stadium needs.
www.chbaseball.com

Campey Imants USA 537
Macclesfield UK
Campey Turf Care Systems
is a forwarding thinking UK
Company, which distributes
sports turf renovation and
maintenance machinery
across the world.
www.campeyturfcare.com

Carolina Green Corp. 236
Indian Trail NC
Licensed sports field
contractor specializing in the
design, construction,
renovation and maintenance
of native or modified soil and
sand based fields.
www.cgcfields.com

Country Stone 658
Milan IL
Crushed red lava sized specif-
ically for infield conditioning
and topdressing along with
custom warning track mix. 
www.countrystone.com

Covermaster Inc. 300
Rexdale Ontario Canada
A leading supplier of
baseball/football athletic
field covers, mound and plate
covers, turf growth blankets,
turf protective systems and
protective wall padding.  
www.covermaster.com

CoverSports USA 525
Philadelphia PA
Manufacturer of ball field
covers, winter turf blankets
and stadium padding.  
www.coversports.com

Dakota Peat & 
Equipment 648
East Grand Forks MN
Manufacturer of top dressing
equipment and supplier of
peat, blending and testing.
www.dakotapeat.com

Diamond Pro 301
Dallas TX
Provides groundskeepers
nationwide a complete line of
professional grounds keeping
products and equipment. 
www.diamondpro.com

Direct Solutions- Agrium
Advanced Technologies 224
Loveland CO
Direct Solutions is focused
on leading the industry in
distributing fertilizer, seed
and effective plant protection
products to the sports turf
industry.
www.aatdirectsolutions.com

DLF International Seeds 343
Halsey OR
The DLF Trifolium Group,
of which DLF International
Seeds is a member, is the
world’s largest producer and
marketer of grass and clover
seed. From the center of
seed production in Halsey,
Oregon, DLF International
Seeds provides outstanding
service to your distribution
network. 
www.dlfis.com  

Dow AgroSciences LLC 585
Fort Worth TX
Dow AgroSciences LLC has
provided quality turf herbi-
cides, insecticides and
fungicides for over 50 years.
We welcome the opportunity
to continue to serve the
Sports Turf industry. 
www.dowagro.com/turf

DryJect Inc 230
Hatboro PA
We are a patent aeration
service with Service Centers
that can amend your turf
almost anywhere in the
world.  We also supply the
new revolutionary Drainage
PC system that can be
installed into existing turf
with minimal disruption.
www.dryject.com

EarthWorks 626
Easton PA
By applying the agronomic
principals of Dr. William
Albrecht along with our soil
first approach, we can help
you grow quality turf in a
sustainable manner while
maximizing the benefits of
using EarthWorks products. 
www.soilfirst.com

ECO Chemical 620
Seattle WA
Manufacturers of 1) the first
and best removable paint
and equipment for synthetic
turf fields and 2) an innova-
tive dehydrated paint for
grass fields that ships in a
cardboard box.
www.ecochemical.com

Ecologel Solutions, LLC 584
Ocala FL
Ecologel Solutions, LLC is an
Ocala, Florida-based
manufacturing company spe-
cializing in the productions of
environmentally responsible
solutions for the sports turf,
landcare and agricultural
markets. Ecologel’s products
include technologies aimed
at drought mitigation, water
conservation and water

management, dust control,
plant nutrition, pond and lake
treatments and surface
coatings.
www.ecologel.com

Engineered Sportfield 
Solutions 591
Bel Air MD
Engineered Sportfield Solu-
tions provides Best Practice
solutions while delivering
proprietary product technolo-
gies that can be used with
any natural or synthetic turf.
ESS products enhance
product performance, while
also offering superior impact
protection, energy absorption
and longer-lasting
performance that is suitable
for all playing surfaces.
www.engineeredsportfield.com

ENP Turf/ENP 
Investments 141
Orient OH
ENP Turf supplies the highest
quality liquid nutrients and
biostimulants in the
industry.  We pride ourselves
in helping turf growers
maximize turfgrass health for
controlled growth and beauti-
ful color.  We also provide
unique products that help
turfgrass overcome difficult
conditions and give the turf
manager tools to manipulate
growth to overcome biotic
and abiotic stresses.
www.enpturf.com

Ewing Irrigation 565
Austin TX
Wholesale distributor in 19
states providing turf
professionals’ quality
products and services.
www.ewing1.com

Fairmount Sports &
Recreation/Fairmount
Minerals 417
Chardon OH
High purity silica sand for
sports fields, synthetic turf,
and recreational areas.
www.fairmount-sports.com
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FieldTurf 503
Montreal Quebec Canada
The world leader in artificial
turf.
www.fieldturf.com

First Products Inc 463
Tifton GA
Manufacturer of the only
patented vibrating tine
aera-vators.  Equipment use
includes aerating, primary
seeding, overseeding,
verti-cutting and incorporated
topdressing.
www.1stproducts.com

Floratine Products 
Group, Inc. 562
Collierville TN
Is your field standing up to
traffic?  Are you moving
water the way you want to? 
www.floratine.com

G2 Turftools, Inc. 513
Athens AL
G2 Turftools is a company
dedicated to providing
precision turf equipment for
sports fields and golf
courses.  Its mission is to
provide experienced quality
turf managers with high
quality products that make
their jobs more cost effective
and help them establish a
new level of playability and
aesthetically beautiful turf.  
www.g2turftools.com

Gail Materials 480
Corona CA
California’s leading producer
of athletic field surfacing
aggregates.  
www.gailmaterials.net

Genan, Inc. 285
Houston TX
Genan is the world’s largest
tire recycler and specializes
in infill for artificial turf.
www.genan.eu

Graco, Inc. 201
Rogers MN
The leader in field marking
equipment. Proven quality,
leading technology. 
www.graco.com/
fieldmarkings

Graff’s Turf Farms, Inc. 425
Fort Morgan CO
High quality turfgrass suited
for golf and athletic surfaces
including Short Cut/Low Mow,
USGA Spec Sand grown
bentgrasses, Texas Hybrids,
custom grows and custom
harvests.  Services include
tearouts, installation,
preparation and maintenance.
www.graffsturffarms.com

Green Source, Inc. 491
Plainfield IL
Green Source, Inc. is a
Turfgrass sod installation
company specializing in thick
cut sod for premium athletic
fields, construction of fields
and renovation utilizing
proprietary equipment and
processes.
www.greensourceusa.com

GreenOne Industries 471
Highlands Ranch CO
Sports field construction,
renovation, maintenance,
and drainage company
serving the U.S. 
www.greenoneindustries.com 



GreensGroomer
WorldWide 325
Indianapolis IN
Manufacture turf-conditioning
equipment for grooming,
compaction relief, debris
removal, and sterilization or
natural and synthetic turf
surfaces.  
www.greensgroomer.com

Grigg Brothers 221
Albion ID
Grigg Brothers is the premier
quality Foliar Fertilizer
company in the turf industry.
www.griggbros.com

Harper Industries 406
Harper KS
Manufacturer of debris
management equipment.
www.harper.com

Harrell’s LLC 321
Athens GA
Harrell’s is a leading pro-
ducer and distributor of cus-
tomized agronomic solutions.
www.harrells.com

Holganix 492
Glen Mills PA
Holganix is a 100 percent
organic bio-nutritional
product that promotes strong
plant health by naturally
increasing resistance to
disease and insect damage
through significant root and
cell wall development. 
www.holganix.com 

Hunter Industries 431
San Marcos CA
Hunter is a leading
manufacturer of efficient
irrigation products that
provide safe and healthy
playing surfaces for all
sports turf applications. 
www.hunterindustries.com

Hydraway Drainage
Systems 464
Bellville IL
Sports Turf drainage systems
for natural & synthetic turf.
www.hydraway.net  

Jacklin Seed 121
Washington Court House OH
Producers and marketers
of world class turf seed.
www.jacklin.com

Jacobsen, A Textron
Company 250
Charlotte NC 
Serves the sports field, golf
and commercial grounds care
markets with a full range of
precision mowers, aerators,
utility vehicles and sprayers.
www.jacobsen.com  

John Deere                 451
Moline IL
John Deere is an industry
leader in the manufacture of
a broad line of quality preci-
sion turf maintenance equip-
ment, tractors and utility
vehicles. Unparalleled parts
and service support provided
by a network of dedicated
John Deere dealers. 
www.johndeere.com  

John Deere Landscapes 451
Moline IL
John Deere Landscapes is
the nation’s leading supplier
of wholesale irrigation,
landscape lighting, nursery,
and turf and maintenance
supplies for green industry
contractors. Dedicated to
becoming the distributor of
choice for landscape, irriga-
tion and turf care profession-
als, John Deere Landscapes
also offers additional
services that support the
core businesses of green
industry contractors. 
www.johndeere
landscapes.com.

Johnston Seed Company 436
Enid OK
Exclusive producers and
marketers of Riviera
Bermuda grass, a truly
superior quality, cold-tolerant
Bermudagrass.
www.Johnstonseed.com

Kifco, Inc. 293 
Havana IL
Kifco is the leading manufac-
turer of traveling irrigation
systems.  Kifco’s B-Series
Water-Reels are used around
the world to irrigate sports
fields and are proudly made
in the USA.  
www.kifco.com

Kromer Co. LLC 590
Plymouth MN
Kromer provides leading
edge/state of the art for
grooming and painting syn-
thetic and natural turf fields.
www.kromerco.com

Kwik Goal Ltd. 226
Quakertown PA
Leading manufacturer of high
quality, durable, safety tested
sports listed equipment. 
www.kwikgoal.com 

Landscapes 
Unlimited, LLC 536
Lincoln NE
Our Recreational Develop-
ment Group’s expertise in
landscaping, irrigation,
drainage and laser grading
has been instrumental in our
capabilities to create
high-class sports fields
(natural or synthetic), trails,
practice fields and parks.  
www.landscapesunlimited.com 

Lebanon Turf 437
Lebanon PA
Lebanon Turf provides
innovative fertilizer; fertilizer/
pesticide combination prod-
ucts; biologicals; organics
and seed to the professional
turfgrass markets. 
www.lebanonturf.com

Lidochem Inc. 384
New Holland PA
Lidochem’s performance
nutrition division develops
and markets unique and
effective organic and conven-
tional plant nutrients,
chelated micronutrients, bio
pesticides, eco fertilizers,
soil amendments and

biostimulants.  Most
products are patented or
patent pending and are safe
for the environment, the
applicator and the consumer.  
www.performance
fertilizers.com

Louisville Slugger/Game
Time Sports Systems 508
Northbrook IL
We offer Louisville Slugger
branded products that are
specialized for Baseball/
Softball field grounds
keeping. These products are
used by professional sports
teams, schools, municipali-
ties and youth leagues. Our
mission is to bring the
highest quality products to
every level of play. 
www.gametime
sportssytems.com

Matrax Inc 113
Lutherville, MD
A leader in an all-purpose
field protection/preservation
system. Our translucent inter-
locking HDPE mats promotes
turf growth and will support
cranes and other heavy rub-
ber tired vehicles.
www.matraxinc.com

Missouri Turf Paint 270
Kansas City MO
Providers of turf paint,
stencils, application
equipment and field lining
systems.
www.missouriturfpaint.com

Mountain View Seeds 227
Salem OR
Wholesale supplier of pre-
mium grass seed products. 
www.mtviewseeds.com 

Natural Sand Company 401
Slippery Rock PA 
DuraEdge is a national
provider of engineered soils
for baseball and softball
infields.
www.duraedge.com
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Nature Safe Natural
and Organic Fertilizers 386
Cold Spring KY
Nature Safe Fertilizers are
made from animal proteins,
not manure. 
www.naturesafe.com

Newstripe Inc. 531
Aurora CO
Newstripe is a manufacturer
of paint striping machines,
drags infield groomers, layout
systems and logo stencils.  
www.newstripe.com 

Northstar Publishing/PRB
Magazine
Medina OH
PRB is written for parks and
recreation directors, staff and
managers by parks and
recreation directors, staff and
managers which means each
article is chock-full of
common-sense solutions to
everyday challenges. Plus,

all subscribers can add their
parks to the new ParksNRe-
views.com mobile app for
FREE!  Visit
www.parksandrecbusiness.co
m today to sign up for your
free subscription!

Oakwood Sod Farm 507
Delmar MD
Supplier of high quality sod,
including Latitude 36,
Northbridge and Patriot
bermudagrass. Grown on
high sand content soils. 
www.oakwoodsod.com

Osburn Materials 481
San Antonio TX
Quarry specializing in sports
field sand and mixes.
www.osburnmaterials.com

Peat Inc. 244
Elk River MN
A unique golf, sports turf
and horticulture peat supply
company affiliated with
Plaisted Companies which
allows them to control the
quality of the process from
peat harvest to final mix.
www.peatinc.com 

Pennington Seed Inc. 330
Madison GA
Premier grass seed company
bringing the most technologi-
cally advanced varieties to the
sports turf managers since
1945.  Also offering fertilizer,
chemicals and skinned
surface materials.
www.penningtonusa.com

Pickseed 527
Tangent OR
As a leading developer of high
performance turfgrass for
more than 30 years, Pickseed
has been committed to high
standards of performance
that ensure reliable product
availability, delivery and
support. 
www.pickseed.com

Pioneer Athletics 369/479
Cleveland OH
Pioneer Athletics is the
leading developer and
manufacturer of natural and
synthetic grass field marking
paints and striping equip-
ment.  Founded in 1905,
Pioneer is the teammate of
over 25,000 high schools,
universities, and professional
athletic organizations.   
www.pioneerathletics.com



Port Industries, Inc. 540
Palmyra MO
Distribution of drainage and
related equipment.
www.portindustries.com

Precision 
Laboratories, LLC 509
Waukegan IL 
Precision Laboratories is a
leading provider of special-
ized chemistries applied to
plants, seeds, soil and water
to maximize resource and
biological performance
potential while stewarding
the environment.
www.precisionlab.com

Pro’s Choice 320
Alpharetta GA
Leading soil conditioner
brand since 1941. 
www.proschoice1.com

Pure Seed 606
Hubbard OR
Research, production and
marketing the finest
turfgrass varieties for athletic
fields. 
www.pureseed.com

Quali-Pro 387
Pasadena TX
Providing quality turf
protection products for the
sports field industry.
www.quali-pro.com

Rain Bird Corporation 602
Tucson AZ
Worldwide leader of irrigation
products to sports arenas,
golf courses and commercial
developments. 
www.rainbird.com

Rain Out LLC 291
Las Vegas NV
Rain Out is a revolutionary,
new product that works for all
teams—from the pros to the
pee wees. With an absorp-
tion ratio of 250 to 1, it is
deemed an incredible,
cost-saving product for high
schools, youth leagues and
municipalities. Rain out
works 10 times faster using
a mere fraction of the
amount of any competitor’s
product.
www.rainoutproducts.com

Redexim North America 364
Fenton MO
Manufacturer of specialized
turf and ground care
equipment produced
especially for aeration,
seeding, topdressing and
environmental maintenance. 
www.redexim.com

Redox Chemicals 580
Burley ID
Redox is a nutrient company
that focuses on innovative
plant growth technology. 
www.redoxchem.com

Seago International 518
Hickory NC
Seago International is the
North American distributor
for worldwide sports turf
maintenance equipment.
Featured products include
the Baseline Edger from
Atom, the BowDry field drying
machine, the Olympic reel
mower and Rotarola rear
roller rotary mower from
Masport, the PortaPump,
the Hover Trimmer, Air Force
Hover Mowers and the full
line of Spyker Spreaders.
www.seagousa.com 

Seed Research 
of Oregon 240
Corvallis OR
Performance seed company
with a full range of products
including bent grass, cool
season and warm season
turf.
www.sroseed.com

Signature Systems 
Group 233
New York NY
Signature Systems Group is
the world’s largest manufac-
turer and renter of temporary
flooring systems that protect
natural grass, artificial turf,
and ice arenas. Our stadium
flooring systems are in use
worldwide at prestigious
arenas and stadiums and
have proven themselves
through extensive use.
www.eventdeck.com

SMG Equipment LLC 571
Auburn WA
For nearly 40 years SMG has
manufactured state-of-the-art
equipment and tools for
installation and maintenance
of running tracks and
synthetic turf fields.  SMG is
recognized worldwide as the
industry leader for quality
and service.
www.smgequipment.com

Smithco 246
Wayne PA
Manufacturers of premier
Sports Turf equipment.  We
provide solutions for today’s
professional grounds
manager.
www.smithco.com

Sod Solutions 566
Mt. Pleasant SC
Researching, developing and
promoting improved turfgrass
varieties worldwide.
www.sodsolutions.com

Southern Athletic
Fields, Inc. 331
Columbia TN
Southern Athletic Field, Inc.
is a supplier of quality infield
mixes, mound clays, clay
bricks, calcined clays and
warning track materials as
well as innovative field
accessories.
www.mulemix.com

Spectrum 
Technologies, Inc. 632
Plainfield IL
Manufacturer of quality
measurement tools such as
moisture meters, weather
stations and nutrient
management.  We help
groundskeepers make better
management decisions. 
www.specmeters.com

Sports Turf Specialists 624
Iowa LA 
We are general contractors
specializing in sports field
construction and mainte-
nance.
www.sportsturfspecialists.net 

Sports Venue Padding by
Artistic Coverings 205
Cerritos CA
Leading manufacturer of
stadium field padding, rail
padding, autogate padding
and sponsor graphics. 
www.sportsvenuepadding.com 

SportsEdge  647
Dallas TX
Manufacturer/supplier of
surface and sub-surface
drain systems, football goals,
soccer goals, and track
equipment.
www.sportsedge.com 

Sports Field Management-
Moose River Media 145
St. Johnsbury VT
We are a monthly trade
publication for field care
professionals managing
playing fields nationwide.
Subscriptions are free to
qualified subscribers.
www.sportsfieldmanagement
magazine.com  
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Weekly newsletter
emailed to you  from the editors

of SportsTurf magazine 

ST Insider brings latest news
and information from around the
USA for sports turf management

professionals 

Visit www.sportsturfonline.com
and click on “E-newsletter”

to register quickly

It’s 

FREE

Sign up for 
ST Insider newsletter
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Sportsfield Specialties 514
Delhi NY
Since 1998 we have been
the innovative industry leader
in the sale and manufacture
of sports construction
equipment. We continue to
meet the demands of modern
sports construction through
innovative design and
state-of-the-art
manufacturing.
www.sportsfieldspecialties. com 

Sports Turf Magazine/
Specialty Information 
Media 169
Palm Springs CA
SportsTurf is the official
magazine of the sports turf
managers association.
BPA-audited and appearing
monthly, SportsTurf is the
industry’s leading source of
news and information for
sports fields and facilities
manager.
www.sportsturfonline.com

Stabilizer Solutions 419
Phoenix, AZ
Infield mixes, mound mixes,
custom blends.  Worldwide
stabilization products.
www.stabilizersolutions.com

STEC Equipment 446
Sandy Springs SC
STEC is an industry leader in
the manufacturing, distribu-
tion, and sales of specialized
turf equipment for over 10
years. With the commitment
to quality products, STEC is
leading the way in importing
cutting edge products and
ideas from the European mar-
ketplace and introducing them
to the American turf industry.
www.stecequipment.com 

SubAir Systems 485
Graniteville SC
Providing solutions to air
movement problems above
and below the surface. 
www.subairsystems.com 

Supaturf Ltd. 225
Leicestershire UK
Supaturf has a long tradition
of manufacturing quality line
marking machines and
paints. 
www.supaturf.co.uk 

Syngenta 441
Olivette MO
Syngenta is the leading
manufacturer of fungicides,
herbicides, and insecticides
and plant growth regulators.
www.syngentaprofessional
products.com 

Synthetic Turf Council 266
Atlanta GA
Based in Atlanta, the
Synthetic Turf Council was
founded in 2003 to promote
the industry and to assist
buyers and end users with
the selection, use and
maintenance of synthetic turf
systems in sports field, golf,
municipal parks, airports,
landscape and residential
applications.  Membership
includes builders, landscape
architects, testing labs,
maintenance providers,
manufacturers, installation
contractors, specialty service
companies, as well as aca-
demics, researchers, athletic
directors, and students.  
www.syntheticturfcouncil.org



Terraplas USA, Inc. 304
Kilgore TX
World’s #1 turf protection
company. Protecting your turf
since 1994.
www.terraplasusa.com

The Andersons 442
Maumee OH
The Andersons is the manu-
facturer of premium granular
fertilizers, insecticides and
professional grade
spreaders.  We also feature
the dispersing granule carrier
DG Pro that gets the active
ingredients to the target area
first.
www.andersonsturf.com 

The Motz Group 264
Cincinnati OH
Design/build and construc-
tion of high performance
natural and synthetic turf
sports fields.
www.themotzgroup.com

The Toro Company 312
Bloomington MN
The Toro Company is a lead-
ing worldwide provider of turf
maintenance equipment and
precision irrigation systems.
Toro has built a tradition of
world-class service, innova-
tion and turf expertise to
help customers’ care for
sports fields, public green
spaces, golf courses, com-
mercial and residential prop-
erties, and agricultural fields.
www.toro.com 

Thomas Turfgrass 579
Wharton TX
Industry leader in providing
quality turfgrass sprigging
and sod installation.
www.thomasturfgrass.com 

Tri-Tex Grass 478
Granbury TX 
Tri-Tex Grass is a warm
season sod supplier. Tri-Tex
specializes in high quality
ready-to-play turf for sports
fields and golf courses.
www.tritexgrass.com 

Turbo Link/TLI-Sports 268
Clearwater FL 
Turbo Link International, Inc.
has extensive experience in
the construction of sports
fields and sports facilities
throughout the US and
abroad. We specialize in
turn-key design-build
services, site preparation
and drainage systems for a
variety of athletic surfaces
and sports facilities.
www.TLIsports.com 

Turf Diagnostics 
& Design 326
Linwood KS
Turf Diagnostics is the lead-
ing testing company serving
the sports turf market.  We
perform laboratory testing of
soils, aggregates, skin areas
and on-site Gmax testing of
fields.
www.turfdiag.com 

Turf Time Equipment 231
York PA
Manufacturer of turf
maintenance equipment—
aerators, top dressers,
verticutters, roller and infield
drags. 
www.turftimeeq.com 

Turf-Tec International 365
Tallahassee FL
We manufacture diagnostic
testing equipment for natural
and artificial turf. 
www.turf-tec.com 

Turface Athletics 306
Buffalo Grove IL
Turface Athletics is the
leader in sports field
maintenance, providing the
industry’s best products to
solve and prevent field
maintenance problems. Our
products are the number one
choice among
groundskeepers. The
complete line of Turface
products has superior
absorption and drainage to
help fight compaction and
create safe playing surfaces
at all levels.
www.turface.com

Turfco 346
Blaine MN
For over 50 years, Turfco has
provided quality and innova-
tive products for sports turf
facilities and ground.
www.turfco.com 

Underhill  512
Lake Forest CA
Underhill has over 32 years
of excellence in worldwide
manufacturing and technical
sales of irrigation and related
products for sportsfields,
golf courses, commercial and
residential.
www.uicorp.net

University of Georgia 393
Athens GA
The University of Georgia
Center for Continuing Educa-

tion offers comprehensive
professional development for
turf industry professionals.
Earn a certificate of comple-
tion in 12 months of less!
www.georgiacenter.uga.
edu/turf 

Varicore Technologies 207
Prinsburg MN
The premier name in
synthetic and natural turf
drainage.
www.multi-flow.com

Ventrac 165
Orrville OH
Ventrac compact tractors and
attachments lead the sports
turf industry in choices for
versatility and durability.
Ventrac gives you the ability
to choose between 30+
attachments such as contour
deck, reel mower, aeration,
leaf blowers and more!
www.ventrac.com

Vitality Seed                 678
Savage MD
VitalityT professional quality
seed i s proven to deliver
high quality andtrusted pefor-
mance for seeding success.
VitalityT blends & mixtures
are formulated by profes-
sional seed experts to pro-
vide the finest, purest,best
performing varieties to meet
the quality demands of our
customers
www.vitalityseed.com
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Waupaca Sand & Solutions 228
Waupaca, WI
Manufacturer of Sure-Hop Infield Mix, Red
Tread Warning Track, Mound Clay, Athletic Field
Topdressing and Custom Greensmix.
www.waupacasand.com

Whitlam Paint Company 630
Wadsworth OH
Manufacturing quality products since 1900. 
www.whitlampaint.com

Wiedenmann North America, LLC 544
Savannah GA
Wiedenmann is a leader in the manufacturing of
turf maintenance equipment for both natural and
artificial turf surfaces.
www.wiedenmannusa.com 

Winfield Solutions 520
Oklahoma City OK
WinField Professional Products has locations
coast to coast dedicated to serving the golf, lawn,
sports turf, ornamental, pest control, aquatics,
and vegetation management industries.   WinField
offers a full line of chemical & fertilizer inputs
along with technical know-how, proprietary tools
and research-based solutions you can trust for
success today, tomorrow and beyond.
www.winfield.com 

Wood Bay Turf Technologies 307
Sun City AZ 
Cut, rake and roll- maintain your turf service
with Wood Bay products.  
www.woodbayturftech.com 

World Class Athletic Surfaces 237
Leland MS
The world’s premier manufacturer of quality field
marking paints. We create custom stencils for
field logos. 
www.worldclasspaints.com

World Sports Turf and Marketing, LLC 586
Valrico FL
Main soccer field contractor for World Cup 2014
in Brazil.  Turn key solutions to new arenas. 
www.worldsportsusa.com 

www.GeeseProblemSolved.com 439
Louisville KY
Solar powered maintenance free and easily
installed units that get rid of geese with 100%
MONEY BACK GUARANTEE. Proven effective on
sports fields, parks and rec and golf courses. 
www.geeseproblemsolved.com 

www.stma.org


